EARTH MATERIALS - - 3/16/23

STONE MOUNTAIN TOP
COMPANY NAMES: 0&6 CONSTRUCTION TRUCKING
BY TONS BY TONS BY TONS
SAND 34.00 28.00 NO BID
BANK RUN "A" 24.50 $ 22.75 3 19.83
BANK RUN "C"
3/4 INCH 24.50 $ 24.25 3 20.93
11/4 INCH[ % 24.50 $ 23.00 20.38
3/4" CRUSHED STONE UNCRUSHED 32.50 $ 26.75 23.68
STONE (55075)
3/8" CRUSHED STONE OR BROKEN 32.50 $ 29.00 5 24,23
STONE (550375
3/8" CRUSHED OR BROKEN STONE/TRAP 32.50 $ 29.00 5 24.23
ROCK (STR0375)
MED. CRUSHED TRAP ROCK/STONE 1 29.50 $ 24.25 5 2203
1/4" (STR125)
MED. CRUSHED TRAP ROCK/STONE 1 24.50 $ 24.35 $ 22.03
1/4" (CT DOT FILE #163-1)
COURSE CRUSHED TRAP 24.50 $ 19.83
ROCK/QUARRY/TORRINGTON (SPAB) NO BID
COURSE CRUSHED TRAP ROCK {SPAB}) 24.50 $ 19.83
NO BID
QUARRY DUST {STRSCR) 39.00 $ 26.50 $ 22.39
ARMOR STONE-DOUBLE WASHED 39.00 $ 38.75
(STR(375 ARMOUR) NO BID

GRAND TOTAL




